INCOME-TAX ACT, 1961°

[43 OF 1961]
[AS AMENDED BY FINANCE ACT, 1999]

An Act to consolidate and amend the law relating to
income-tax and super-tax

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Twelfth Year of the Republic c
India as follows :—

CHAPTERI
PRELIMINARY

Short title, extent and commencement.

11. 2(1) This Act may be called the Income-tax Act, 1961.

(2) It extends to the whole of India.

(3) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, it shall come into force on the 1st
of April, 1962.

Definitions.

2. Inthis Act, unless the context otherwise requires,—

3[(1) “advance tax” meansthe advance tax payable in accordance with
provisions of Chapter XVII-C;]

1. For applicability of the Act to State of Sikkimeesection 26 of the Finance Act, 1989.
For extension of Act to continental shelf of InddagNotification No. GSR 304(E), dated
31-3-1983. For detailseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

2. For effective date for the applicability of the Actin the State of SikkeeNotification No.

SO 148(E), dated 23-2-1989. For detaslseTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

3. Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989.

* Amendments made by the Income-tax (Second Amendment) Act, 1998 and the Finance Al
1999, notwithstanding the dates from which they come into effect have been printed in italic
enclosed with bold square brackets. Amendments made by the Income-tax (Amendment) A
1998, and the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1998, coming into force from April 1, 1999 have als
been printed in italics but enclosed within medium square brackets.

11

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(1A) I.T. ACT, 1961 1.2

“*@aA)] S“agriculturalincome®”mean&—

°[(a) anyrentorrevenue derived from land which is situated in Indi
and is used for agricultural purposes;]
(b) anyincome derived from such land by—
(i) agriculture;or
(it) the performance by a cultivator or receiver of rent-in-kind o
any process ordinarily employed by a cultivator or receive

of rent-in-kind to render the produce raised or received k
him fit to be taken to market; or

(iii) the sale by a cultivator or receiver of rent-in-kind of the
produce raised or received by him, in respect of which n
process has been performed other than a process of -
nature described in paragraph 6f this sub-clause;

(c) anyincome derived from any building owned and occupied by tt
receiver of the rent or revenue of any such land, or occupit
by the cultivator or the receiver of rent-in-kind, of any land witt
respectto which, orthe produce of which, any process mention
in paragraphsi() and {ii ) of sub-clauseh) is carried on:
°[Provided that—

(i) the buildingis on orinthe immediate vicinity of the land, anc
is a building which the receiver of the rent or revenue or th
cultivator, or the receiver of rent-in-kind, by reason of hi:
connection with the land, requires as a dwelling house, or
a store-house, or other out-building, and

(i) the land is either assessed to land revenue in India or
subjectto alocal rate assessed and collected by officers of
Government as such or where the land is not so assesse
land revenue or subjectto alocal rate, itis not situated—

(A) inanyareawhich is comprised within the jurisdiction of
a municipality (whether known as a municipality, munici-
pal corporation, notified area committee, town are:
committee, town committee or by any other name) or
cantonment board and which has a population of nc

4. Renumbered as claus&A) by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f.
1-4-1989.

5. For relevant case lawseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

6. See rules 7 and 8 for manner of computation of income which is partially agricultural an
partially from businessSeealso Appendix Two for an analysis of rules 7 and 8.

7. The Finance Act, 1973 introduced for the first time a scheme of partially integrat:
taxation of non-agricultural income with incomes derived from agriculture for th
purposes of determining the rate of income-tax that will apply to certain non-corpore
assessees. The scheme is since continued by the Annual Finance Acts. The provis
applicable for the assessment year 1999-2000 are contained in se@)i@(1y)(c) and
Part IV of the First Schedule to the Finance Act, 1999.

8. Sealso Instruction No. 745 [F. No. 228/28/74-IT(A-11)], dated 30-8-1974 and Circular Nc
310, dated 29-7-1981. For detadgeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

9. Substituted by the Taxation Laws (Amendment) Act, 1970, w.r.e.f. 1-4-1962.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



13

CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(1B)

less than ten thousand according to the last precedil
census of which the relevant figures have been pul
lished before the first day of the previous year ; or

19B) in any area within such distance, not being more tha
eight kilometres, from the local limits of any municipality
or cantonment board referred to in iteA),(as the
Central Government may, having regard to the extel
of, and scope for, urbanisation of that area and othe
relevant considerations, specify in this behalf by noti
fication in the Official Gazette.]

I Explanation—For the removal of doubts, itis hereby declared the
revenue derived from land shall not include and shall be deem
never to have included any income arising from the transfer of a
land referred to initenaj or item @) of sub-clausdif) of clause 14)

of this section ;]

12[13[(1B)] “amalgamation”, in relation to companies, means the merger of one

more companies with another company or the merger of two or mc
companies to form one company (the company or companies wh
so merge being referred to as the amalgamating company
companies and the company with which they merge or which
formed as aresult of the merger, as the amalgamated company
such a manner that—

(i) allthe property of the amalgamating company or companie
immediately before the amalgamation becomes the property oft
amalgamated company by virtue of the amalgamation ;

(i) allthe liabilities of the amalgamating company or companie
immediately before the amalgamation become the liabilities «
the amalgamated company by virtue of the amalgamation ;

(iii) shareholders holding not less th&mine-tenthin value of the
shares in the amalgamating company or companies (other tt
shares already held therein immediately before the amalg
mation by, or by a nominee for, the amalgamated company or
subsidiary) become shareholders of the amalgamated compe
by virtue of the amalgamation,

otherwise than as aresult of the acquisition of the property of o
company by another company pursuant to the purchase of st
property by the other company or as a result of the distribution
such property to the other company after the winding up of the firs
mentioned company ;]

10.

11.
12.
13.

For specified urban areas, refer Taxmann’s Direct Taxes Circulars, 1999 edn., Vol. 1,
1.9-1.57.

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1989, with retrospective effect from 1-4-1970.

Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1967, w.e.f. 1-4-1967.

Renumbered as claus&B) by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f.
1-4-1989.

13a.Words “three-fourths” shall be substituted for “nine-tenths” by the Finance Act, 1999, w.e

1-4-2000.
REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(7A)

@)

©)
4)

©)

(6)

16( 7)

@A

I.T. ACT, 1961 1.4

“annual value”, in relation to any property, means its annual value
determined under section 23 ;

14[* * *]

“Appellate Tribunal”’ means the Appellate Tribunal constituted unde
section 252

“approved gratuity fund” means a gratuity fund which has been al
continuesto be approved by &€ hief Commissioner or Commis-
sioner]in accordance with the rules contained in Part C of the Fou
Schedule;

“approved superannuation fund” means a superannuation fund
any part of a superannuation fund which has beenamtthues to be

approved by th&[Chief Commissioner or Commissioner] in accor-
dance with the rules contained in Part B of the Fourth Schedule ;

“assessee” means a person by whamy tax] or any other sum of

money is payable under this Act, and includes—

(a) every personinrespectof whom any proceeding under this A
has been taken for the assessment of hisincome or of the incc
of any other personinrespect of which he is assessable, or of
loss sustained by him or by such other person, or of the amol
of refund due to him or to such other person;

(b) every personwhois deemedto be an assessee under any pr
sion of this Act ;

(c) every personwhoisdeemedto be an assessee in default ur
any provision of this Act ;

“Assessing Officer” means the Assistant Commissiéii@rDeputy
Commissionerfjor Assistant Directorff[or Deputy Director] or the
Income-tax Officer who is vested with the relevant jurisdiction b
virtue of directions or orders issued under sub-section (1) or su
section (2) of section 120 or any other provision of this Act, and tt
2[Joint Commissioner or Joint Director] who is directed under claus
(b) of sub-section (4) of that section to exercise or perform all or at
ofthe powers and functions conferred on,or assigned to,an Asses:
Officer under this Act ;]

14.

15.

16.
17.
18.
19.
20.
21.

Clause 8) omitted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988. Prior t
its omission, clausesf stood as under :

‘(3) “Appellate Assistant Commissioner” means a person appointed to be an Appell
Assistant Commissioner of Income-tax under sub-section (1) of section 117;’
Substituted for “Commissioner” by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.
1-4-1988.

For relevant case lawseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

Substituted for “income-tax or super-tax” by the Finance Act, 1965, w.e.f. 1-4-1965.
Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1998, w.e.f. 1-10-1998.

Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1996, w.e.f. 1-10-1996.

Substituted for “Deputy Commissioner or Deputy Director” by the Finance (No. 2) Ac
1998, w.e.f. 1-10-1998. Earlier “or Deputy Director” was inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Ac
1996, w.e.f. 1-10-1996.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



15

CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(14)

(8) “assessment”includesreassessment;

(9) “assessmentyear” means the period of twelve months commenc
onthe 1stday of April every year ;

2[(9A) “Assistant Commissioner” means a person appointedto be an Assis
Commissioner of Income-ta®[or a Deputy Commissioner of
Income-tax] under sub-section (1) of section 117 ;]

(100 “average rate ofincome-tax” means the rate arrived at by dividing t
amount of income-tax calculated on the totalincome, by such to
income;

2(11) “block of assets” means a group of assets falling within a class of ass
comprising—
() tangible assets, being buildings, machinery, plant or furniture;

(b) intangible assets, being know-how, patents, copyrights, trad
marks, licences, franchises or any other business or commerc
rights of similar nature,

in respect of which the same percentage of depreciation is presgribe

(120 “Board” means th&[Central Board of Direct Taxes constituted unde!
the Central Boards of Revenue Act, 1963 (54 of 1963)];

25(13) “business”includes any trade, commerce or manufacture or a
adventure or concern in the nature of trade, commerce or mar
facture;

25(14) 2™capital asset” means property of any kind held by an assess
whether or not connected with his business or profession, but dc
notinclude—

(i) anystock-in-trade, consumable stores or raw materials held for 1
purposes of his business or profession ;

2[(ii) personal effects, that is to say, movable property (includin
wearing apparel and furniture, but excluding jewellery) held fo
personal use by the assessee or any member of his famr
dependenton him.

22.
23.
24.

25.

26.
27.

28.

Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1998, w.e.f. 1-10-1998.

Substitutedijbid., w.e.f. 1-4-1999.Prior to its substitution, clausé@), as inserted by the

Taxation Laws (Amendment & Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1986, w.e.f. 1-4-1988, re.

asunder:

‘(11) “block of assets” means a group of assets falling within a class of assets, be
buildings, machinery, plant or furniture, in respect of which the same percenta
of depreciation is prescribed ;’

Original clause was earlier omitted by the Finance Act, 1965, w.e.f. 1-4-1965.

Substituted for “Central Board of Revenue constituted under the Central Board

Revenue Act, 1924 (4 of 1924)” by the Central Boards of Revenue Act, 1963, w.e.f. 1-1-19¢

For relevant case lawseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

Sealso Letter F. No. 34/11/65-1T(A-l), dated 15-1-1966. For detsd@les] axmann’s Master

Guide to Income-tax Act.

Substituted by the Finance Act, 1972, w.e.f. 1-4-1973.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(14)

I.T. ACT, 1961 1.6

Explanation—For the purposes of this sub-clause, “jewellery’
includes—

C)

(b)

ornaments made of gold, silver, platinum or any othe
precious metal or any alloy containing one or more of suc
precious metals, whether or not containing any precious
semi-precious stone, and whether or not worked or sev
into any wearing apparel ;

precious or semi-precious stones, whether ornotsetina
furniture, utensil or other article or worked or sewn into an
wearing apparel ;]

29[(iii) agriculturallandin India, not being land situate—

(a)

30( b)

in any areawhich is comprised within the jurisdiction of
municipality (whether known as a municipality, municipal
corporation, notified area committee, town area committe
town committee, or by any other name) or a cantonme!
board and which has a population of not less than te
thousand according to the last preceding census of which't
relevant figures have been published before the first day
the previous year ; or

in any area within such distance, not being more than eig
kilometres, from the local limits of any municipality or
cantonment board referred to in itea),(as the Central
Government may, having regard to the extent of, and sco
for, urbanisation of that area and other relevant conside
ations, specify in this behalf by notification in the Official
Gazette ;]

3(iv) 6Y2percentGold Bonds, 197qr 7 per cent Gold Bonds, 1980, ]
33[or National Defence Gold Bonds, 1980,] issued by the Centr
Government;]

%4(v) Special Bearer Bonds, 1991, issued by the Central Governmer

The following sub-clause (vi) shall be inserted after sub-clause (v)
in clause (14) of section 2 by the Finance Act, 1999, w.e.f.
1-4-2000:

(vi) Gold DepositBondsissued underthe Gold Deposit Scheme, 1¢
notified by the Central Government;

29.
30.

31.
32.
33.

34.

Substituted for “iji ) agricultural land in India” by the Finance Act, 1970, w.e.f. 1-4-1970.
For specified urban areas, refer Taxmann’s Direct Taxes Circulars, 1999 edn., Vol

pp. 1.9-1.57.

Inserted by the Taxation Laws (Amendment) Act, 1962, w.e.f. 13-12-1962.
Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1965, w.e.f. 1-4-1965.
Inserted by the Taxation Laws (Amendment & Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1965, w.e€

4-12-1965.

Inserted by the Special Bearer Bonds (Immunities and Exemptions) Act, 1981, w.e

12-1-1981.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.7

CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(18)

35(15) s®charitable purpose”includesrelief of the poor, education, medic
relief, and the advancement of any other object of general pub
utility 37[* * *] ;

%[(15A) “Chief Commissioner” means a person appointed to be a Chief Co

missioner of Income-tax under sub-section (1) of section 117 ;]

*[*1(15B)]

“I(16A

“child”, inrelation to an individual, includes a step-child and ar

adopted child of that individual ;]

4[(16) “Commissioner’ means a person appointed to be a Commissionel
Income-tax under sub-section (1) of section 7 *] ;]

“Commissioner (Appeals)” means a person appointed to be a Comn

sioner of Income-tax (Appeals) under sub-section (1) of section 11°
“[(17) “company” means—

0]
(it)

(iii})

(iv)

any Indian company, or

any body corporate incorporated by or under the laws of
country outside India, or

any institution, association or body which is or was assessable
was assessed as a company for any assessment year unde
Indian Income-tax Act, 1922 (11 of 1922), or which is or wa:
assessable or was assessed under this Act as a company fot
assessmentyear commencing on or before the 1stday of Ap
1970, or

any institution, association or body, whether incorporated or n
and whether Indian or non-Indian, which is declared by gener
or special order of the Board to be a company :

Providedthat such institution, association or body shadldemed

to be acompany only for such assessment year or assessn
years (whether commencing before the 1st day of April, 1971,
on or after that date) as may be specified in the declaration ;]

(18 “company in which the public are substantially interested”—a con
pany is said to be a company in which the public are substantia
interested—

“1(a)

ifitisa company owned by the Government or the Reserve Ba
of India or in which not less than forty per cent of the shares a

35.

36.
37.

38.
39.
40.
41.
42.

43.
44.
45.

Sealso Circular No. 395, dated 24-9-1984. For detageTaxmann’s Master Guide to
Income-tax Act.

For relevant case lawseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

“not involving the carrying on of any activity for profit” omitted by the Finance Act, 1983.
w.e.f. 1-4-1984.

Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

Inserted by the Taxation Laws (Amendment) Act, 1975, w.e.f. 1-4-1976.

Renumbered by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.
Substituted by the Finance Act, 1970, w.e.f. 1-4-1970.

“, and includes a person appointed to be an Additional Commissioner of Income-tax un
that sub-section” omitted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-198
Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1977, w.e.f. 10-7-1978.

Substituted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1971, w.e.f. 1-4-1971.

Substituted by the Finance Act, 1964, w.e.f. 1-4-1964.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(18) I.T. ACT, 1961 1.8

held (whether singly or taken together) by the Government or tl
Reserve Bank of India or a corporation owned by that bank ; c

“¥[(aq) ifitis a company which is registered under section 25 of th
Companies Act, 1956 (1 of 1936)or

(ab) ifitisa company having no share capital and if, having regard

its objects, the nature and composition of its membership al

otherrelevant considerations, itis declared by order of the Bos

to be a company in which the public are substantially interestet

Providedthat such company shall be deemedto be acompan:
which the public are substantially interested only for such asse
mentyear or assessmentyears (whether commencing before
1stday of April, 1971, or on or after that date) as may be specifi
inthe declaration ; or]

“(ac) ifitis a mutual benefitfinance company, thatis to say, a compal
which carries on, as its principal business, the business
acceptance of deposits from its members and which is declarec
the Central Government under section 62@Athe Com-
paniesAct, 1956 (1 of 1956), to beNidhi or Mutual Benefit
Society ; or]

5(ad) ifitisacompany, wherein shares (not being shares entitled t
fixed rate of dividend whether with or without a further right to
participate in profits) carrying not less than fifty per cent of the
voting power have been allotted unconditionally to, or acquire
unconditionally by, and were throughout the relevant previou
year beneficially held by, one or more co-operative societies;

S(b) ifitisacompany which is notgrivate company as defined in
the Companies Act, 1956 (1 of 1956), and the conditions specifit
eitherinitemA) orinitem @) are fulfilled, namely :(—

(A) sharesinthe company (not being shares entitled to a fix
rateof dividend whether with or without a further right to
participate in profits) were, as on the last day of the releva
previous year, listed in arecognised stock exchange in Inc
in accordance with the Securities Contracts (Regulation) Ac
1956 (42 0of 1956), and any rules made thereunder ;

53[(B) sharesinthe company (notbeing shares entitled to a fix
rate of dividend whether with or without a further right to

46.
47.
48.
49.

50.
51.

52.

53.

Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1971, w.e.f. 1-4-1971.

For text of section 25 of the Companies Act, 19&&eAppendix One.

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1985, with retrospective effect from 1-4-1984.

For text of section 620A of the Companies Act, 1956, and notified Nidhi therewseger,
Appendix One.

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1992, w.e.f. 1-4-1993.

Substituted by the Finance Act, 1969, w.e.f. 1-4-1970. Earlier, clbps@a¢ amended first by
the Finance Act, 1965, w.e.f. 1-4-1965 and then by the Finance Act, 1966, w.e.f. 1-4-19¢
Clausef(i) of section 3(1) of the Companies Act, 1956, defines “private company”. For te
of section 3seeAppendix One.

Substituted by the Finance Act, 1983, w.e.f. 2-4-1983.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.9

19

*1(194

(19AA)

CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(19AA)

participate in profits) carrying not less than fifty per cent o
the voting power have been allotted unconditionally to, ©
acquired unconditionally by, and were throughout the rels
vant previous year beneficially held by—

(a) the Government, or
(b) acorporation established by a Central, State or Pr
vincial Act, or
() any company to which this clause applies or an
subsidiary company of such compafjif the whole of
the share capital of such subsidiary company has be
held by the parent company or by its nominees throug|
out the previous year.]
Explanation—In its application to an Indian company whose
business consists mainly in the construction of ships orin tt
manufacture or processing of goods or in mining orin th
generation or distribution of electricity or any other form of
power, item B) shall have effect as if for the words “not less
than fifty per cent”, the words “not less than forty per cent
had been substituted ;]]
“co-operative society” means a co-operative society registered unc
the Co-operative Societies Act, 1912 (2 of 1912), or under any ott
lawfor the time being in force in any State for the registration of cc
operative societies;
“Deputy Commissioner” means a person appointed to be a Dept
Commissioner of Income-t&%* * *] under sub-section (1) of section
117;

The following clauses (19AA) and (19AAA) shall be inserted
after clause (19A) of section 2 by the Finance Act, 1999, w.e.f.
1-4-2000:

“demerger”, in relation to companies, means the transfer, pursuant t
a scheme of arrangement under sections 391 to 394 of the Compar
Act, 1956 (1 of 1956), by a demerged company of its one or ma
undertakings to any resulting company in such a manner that—

() allthe property of the undertaking, being transferred by th
demerged company, immediately before the demerger, becor
the property of the resulting company by virtue of the demerge

(i) all the liabilities relatable to the undertaking, being transferred by the
demerged company, immediately before the demerge
become the liabilities of the resulting company by virtue of th
demerger;

54.

55.
56.

Substituted for “where such subsidiary company fulfils the conditions laid down in claus

(b) of section 108” by the Finance Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.
Words “or an Additional Commissioner of Income-tax” omitted by the Finance (No. 2) Ac

1998, w.e.f. 1-10-1998. Earlier the quoted words were inserted by the Finance Act, 19
w.e.f. 1-6-1994.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(19AA)

I.T. ACT, 1961 1.10

(i) the property and the liabilities of the undertaking or undertakings
being transferred by the demerged company are transferred
values appearing in its books of account immediately before tt
demerger;

(iv) theresulting company issues, in consideration of the demerger,
sharesto the shareholders of the demerged company on a prop
tionate basis;

(v) the shareholders holding not less than three-fourths in value «
the shares in the demerged company (other than shares alrea
held therein immediately before the demerger, or by a nomine
for, the resulting company or, its subsidiary) become shareholdel
of the resulting company or companies by virtue of the demerge

*otherwise than as aresult of the acquisition of the property or asse
ofthe demerged company or any undertaking thereof by the resulti
company;

(vi) thetransfer ofthe undertakingis on a going concern basis;

(vii) the demergerisinaccordance with the conditions, if any, notifie
under sub-section (5) of section 72A by the Central Government
this behalf.

Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this clause, “undertaking” shall
include any part of an undertaking, or a unit or division of an
undertaking or a business activity taken as a whole, but does n
include individual assets or liabilities or any combination thereof no
constituting a business activity.

Explanation 2.—or the purposes of this clause, the liabilities referred
to in sub-clauseii), shall include—

(a) the liabilities which arise out of the activities or operations of the
undertaking;

(b) the specific loans or borrowings (including debentures) raised
incurred and utilised solely for the activities or operations of the
undertaking; and

(c) in cases, other than those referred to in claweo( clause ), so
much of the amounts of general or multipurpose borrowings, |
any, of the demerged company as stand in the same proporti
which the value of the assets transferred in a demerger bears to t
total value of the assets of such demerged company immediat
before the demerger.

Explanation 3—For determining the value of the property referred to
in sub-clauseiii), any change in the value of assets consequent to the
revaluation shall be ignored.

Explanation 4—For the purposes of this clause, the splitting up or the
reconstruction of any authority or a body constituted or establishe
under a Central, State or Provincial Act, or a local authority or a public
sector company, into separate authorities or bodies or local authoritie
or companies, as the case may be, shall be deemed to be a demerg

*The words

‘otherwise...company’ should appear beferplanation 1.
REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN’S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.11 CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(22)

suchsplit up or reconstruction fulfils the conditions specified in sub:
clauses i) to (vii) of this clause, to the extent applicable;

(19AAA) “demerged company” means the company whose undertaking

transferred, pursuant to a demerger, to a resulting company;

(19B) “Deputy Commissioner (Appeals)” means a person appointed to be
Deputy Commissioner of Income-tax (Appeal§pr an Additional
Commissioner of Income-tax (Appeals)] under sub-section (1) c
section 117 ;]

%8[(19C) “Deputy Director” means a person appointed to be a Deputy Directt

of Income-taxé¥* * *] under sub-section (1) of section 117 ;]

(20) *™director”, “manager” and “managing agent”, in relation to a com-
pany, have theneanings respectively assigned to them in the Comp:
nies Act, 1956 (1 of 1956) ;

6(21) “Director General or Director” means a person appointed to be
Director General of Income-tax or, as the case may be, a Director
Income-tax, under sub-section (1) of section 117, and includes
person appointed under that sub-section to®jan Additional
Director of Income-tax or] &[Joint] Director of Income-tax or an
Assistant Directofor Deputy Director] of Income-tax ;]

65(22) %¢“dividend” includes—

(a) any distribution by a company of accumulated profits, whethe
capitalised or not, if such distribution entails the release by th
company to its shareholders of all or any part of the assets of t
company ;

(b) any distribution to its shareholders by a company of debenture
debenture-stock, or deposit certificates in any form, wheth
with or without interest, and any distribution to its preference

57.
58.
59.

60.

61.

62.
63.
64.
65.

66.

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1994, w.e.f. 1-6-1994.

Insertedjbid.

Words “or an Additional Director of Income-tax” omitted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 199¢

w.e.f. 1-10-1998.

Clauses 13), (24) and @5) of section 2 of the Companies Act, 1956, define expression

“director”, “manager” and “managing agent”, respectively. For text of provisises,

Appendix One.

Substituted for the following claus2X) by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987,

w.e.f. 1-4-1988 :

‘(21) “Director of Inspection” means a person appointed to be a Director of Inspecti
under sub-section (1) of section 117, and includes a person appointed to be
Additional Director of Inspection, a Deputy Director of Inspection or an Assistar
Director of Inspection ;’

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1994, w.e.f. 1-6-1994.

Substituted for “Deputy” by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1998, w.e.f. 1-10-1998.

Insertedjbid.

Sealso Circular No. 5-P (para 56), dated 9-10-1967. For det®&f,axmann’s Master

Guide to Income-tax Act.

For relevant case lawseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(22)

(c)

(d)

(e)

bu
()

*[(ia)

(it)

—

I.T. ACT, 1961 1.12

shareholders of shares by way of bonus, to the extent to which t
company possesses accumulated profits, whether capitalised
not ;

any distribution made to the shareholders of a company on i
liquidation, to the extent to which the distribution is attributable
to the accumulated profits of the company immediately before it
liquidation, whether capitalised or not ;

any distribution to its shareholders by a company on the redu
tion of its capital, to the extent to which the company possess
accumulated profits which arose after the end of the previot
year ending next before the 1st day of April, 1933, whether suc
accumulated profits have been capitalised or not ;

any payment by a company, not being a company in which tt
public are substantially interested, of any sum (whether as repr
senting a part of the assets of the company or otherWisedde
after the 31st day of May, 1987, by way of advance or loan to
shareholder, being a person who is the beneficial owner of shar
(not being shares entitled to a fixed rate of dividend whether wit
or without a right to participate in profits) holding not less thar
ten per cent of the voting power, or to any concern in which suc
shareholder is a member or a partner and in which he has
substantial interest (hereafter in this clause referred to as the s:
concern)] or any payment by any such company on behalf, or f
the individual benefit, of any such shareholder, to the extent t
which the company in either case possesses accumulat
profits ;

“dividend” does not include—

a distribution made in accordance with sub-claugeof sub-
clause () in respect of any share issued for full cash considel
ation, where the holder of the share is not entitled in the event
liquidation to participate in the surplus assets ;

a distribution made in accordance with sub-claugeof sub-
clause @) in so far as such distribution is attributable to the
capitalised profits of the company representing bonus shar
allotted to its equity shareholders after the 31st day of Marcl
1964,%9and before the 1st day of April, 1965] ;]

any advance or loan made to a shareholder the said concern]
by a company in the ordinary course of its business, where tl
lending of money is a substantial part of the business of th
company ;

67. Substituted for “by way of advance or loan to a shareholder, being a person who hz
substantial interest in the company,” by the Finance Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

68. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1965, w.e.f. 1-4-1965.

69. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1966, w.e.f. 1-4-1966.

70. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN’S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.13

"[(22A)

CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(22A)

(iii) any dividend paid by a company which is set off by the compan
againstthe whole or any part of any sum previously paid by it ar
treated as a dividend within the meaning of sub-claagdd the
extent to which it is so set off;

The following sub-clauses (iv) and (v) shall be inserted after sub-
clause (iii) in clause (22) of section 2 by the Finance Act, 1999,
w.e.f. 1-4-2000:

(iv) any payment made by a company on purchase of its own shal
from a shareholder in accordance with the provisions of sectio
77A of the Companies Act, 1956 (1 of 1956);

(v) anydistribution of shares pursuant to a demerger by the resultin
company to the shareholders of the demerged company (whett
or not there is a reduction of capital in the demerged company

Explanation 1—The expression “accumulated profits”, wherever it
occursin this clause, shall notinclude capital gains arising before t
1stday of April, 1946, or after the 31st day of March, 1948, and befo
the 1st day of April, 1956.

Explanation 2—The expression “accumulated profits” in sub-clause:
(a), (b), (d and €), shall include all profits of the company up to the
date of distribution or payment referred to in those sub-clauses, a
in sub-claused) shall include all profits of the company up to the date
of liquidation,”[but shall not, where the liquidation is consequent or
the compulsory acquisition of its undertaking by the Government ¢
a corporation owned or controlled by the Government under any la
for the time being in force, include any profits of the company prio
to three successive previous years immediately preceding the pre
ous year in which such acquisition took place].

[Explanation 3—For the purposes of this clause,—

(a) “concern” means a Hindu undivided family, or a firm or an
association of persons or a body of individuals or a company

(b) a person shall be deemed to have a substantial interest ir
concern, other than a company, if he is, at any time during tt
previous year, beneficially entitled to not less than twenty pe
cent of the income of such concern ;]

“domestic company” means an Indian company, or any other cor
pany which, in respect of its income liable to tax under this Act, he
made the prescribed arrangements for the declaration and payme
within India, of the dividends (including dividends on preference
shares) payable out of such income ;]

71. Inserted by the Direct Taxes (Amendment) Act, 1964, w.r.e.f. 1-4-1962.
72. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.
73. Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(24) I.T. ACT, 1961 1.14

“[79[(22B)] “fair market value”, in relation to a capital asset, means—
(i) the price that the capital asset would ordinarily fetch on sale in tt
open market on the relevant date ; and
(i) where the price referred to in sub-clauBeig not ascertainable,
such price as may be determined in accordance with the rul
made under this Act ;]

(23) "firm”, “partner” and “partnership” have the meanings respectively
assigned to them in the Indian Partnership Act, 1932 (9 of 1932) ; b
the expression “partner” shall also include any person who, being
minor, has been admitted to the benefits of partnership ;

[(23A) “foreign company” means a company which is not a domesti
company ;]
8(24) “income”includes—
(i) profits and gains ;
(ii) dividend ;

[(iia) voluntary contributions received by a trust created wholly o
partly for charitable or religious purposes or by an institutior
established wholly or partly for such purpo8%sr by an associ-
ation or institution referred to in claus2lj or clause23), or by
a fund or trust or institution referred to in sub-clauisg ¢r sub-
clause ¥) of clause 230C), of section 10].

Explanation—For the purposes of this sub-clause, “trust”
includes any other legal obligation ;]

81(iii) the value of any perquisite or profitin lieu of salary taxable unde
clauses 2) and @) of section 17 ;

74. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1964, w.e.f. 1-4-1964.

75. Renumbered as claus22B) by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f.
1-4-1989.

76. Section 4 of the Indian Partnership Act, 1932, defines expressions “firm”, “partner” al
“partnership” as follows :

‘ “Partnership” is the relation between persons who have agreed to share the profits
business carried on by all or any of them acting for all.

Persons who have entered into partnership with one another are called individue
“partners” and collectively “a firm”, and the name under which their business is carried
is called the “firm name”.’

77. Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989.

78. Forrelevant case lawseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

79. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1972, w.e.f. 1-4-1973.

80. Substituted for “or by a trust or institution of national importance referred to in clduse (
of sub-section (1) of section 80F” by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1989, w.e
1-4-1989. Earlier, the said expression was substituted for “, not being contributions me
with aspecific direction that they shall form part of the corpus of the trust or institution
by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, with effect from the same date.

81. Seealso Board’s Letter to Indian Merchants Chamber published in Chamber’s Annu
Report, 1963, p. 87. For detailsgeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.15 CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(24)

82[(iiia) ®any special allowance or benefit, other than perquisite include
under sub-clauseii(), specifically granted to the assessee to mee
expenses wholly, necessarily and exclusively for the perfc
mance of the duties of an office or employment of profit ;

(iiib) ®%any allowance granted to the assessee either to meet his p
sonal expenses at the place where the duties of his office
employment of profit are ordinarily performed by him or at:
placewhere he ordinarily resides or to compensate him for th
increased cost of living ;]

84iv) the value of any benefit or perquisite, whether convertible int
money or not, obtained from a company either by a director or k
a person who has a substantial interest in the company, or b
relative of the director or such person, and any sum paid by al
such company in respect of any obligation which, but for suc
payment, would have been payable by the director or oth
person aforesaid ;

8[(iva) the value of any benefit or perquisite, whether convertible int
money or not, obtained by any representative assessee me
tioned in clauseiii) or clauseif) of sub-section (1) of section 160
or by any person on whose behalf or for whose benefit al
incomeis receivable by the representative assessee (such pers
being hereafterin this sub-clause referred to as the “beneficiary
and any sum paid by the representative assessee in respect of
obligation which, but for such payment, would have been payab
by the beneficiary ;]

(v) any sum chargeable to income-tax under clausg¢sd {ii) of

section 28 or section 41 or section 59 ;

8¢ (va) ggy sum chargeable to income-tax under claiige)(of section

87[(vb) an);]sum chargeable to income-tax under clauige)(of section

88 (vc) zi);]sum chargeable to income-tax under clause) (of section

89[(vd)] t2h8e’3/alue of any benefit or perquisite taxable under claiwvj®f
section 28 ;

82. Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1989, w.r.e.f. 1-4-1962.

83. Sealso Circular No. 701, dated 23-3-1995. For detaggeTaxmann’'s Master Guide to
Income-tax Act.

84. Seealso Board’s Letter to Indian Merchants Chamber published in Chamber’s Annt
Report,1963, p. 87. For detailseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

85. Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1980, w.e.f. 1-4-1980.

86. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1990, w.r.e.f. 1-4-1962.

87. Insertedjbid., w.r.e.f. 1-4-1967.

88. Insertedjbid., w.r.e.f. 1-4-1972.

89. Reletteredibid.,w.r.e.f. 1-4-1962. Earlier the original sub-clauga)was inserted by the
Finance Act, 1964, w.e.f. 1-4-1964.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(25A) I.T. ACT, 1961 1.16

%[(ve) any sum chargeable to income-tax under clawdeof section
28]

(vi) any capital gains chargeable under section 45 ;

(vii) the profits and gains of any business of insurance carried on |
a mutual insurance company or by a co-operative society, cor
puted in accordance with section 44 or any surplus taken to |
such profits and gains by virtue of provisions contained in th
First Schedule ;

9(viii) [Omitted by the Finance Act, 1988, w.e.f. 1-4-1988. Original suk
clause yiii ) was inserted by the Finance Act, 1964, w.e.f. 1-4-1964

9(ix) any winnings from lotteries, crossword puzzles, races includin
horse races, card games and other games of any sort or fra
gambling or betting of any form or nature whatsoever ;]

%[(x) any sum received by the assessee from his employees
contributions to any provident fund or superannuation fund o
any fund set up under the provisions of the Employees’ Sta
Insurance Act, 1948 (34 of 1948), or any other fund for the welfar
of such employees ;]

%(xi) any sum received under a Keyman insurance policy including tt
sum allocated by way of bonus on such policy.
Explanation—For the purposes of this clause, the expressio
“Keyman insurance policy” shall have the meaning assigned to
in the Explanationto clause 10D) of section 10 ;]

(25) “Income-tax Officer” means a person appointed to be an Income-tz
Officer under*s[* * *] section 117 ;

%[(25A) “India” shall be deemed to include the Union territories of Dadra an

Nagar Haveli, Goat, Daman and Diu, and Pondicherry,—
(a) as respects any period, for the purposes of section 6 ; and

(b) as respects any period included in the previous year, for ti
purposes of making any assessment for the assessment y
commencing on the 1st day of April, 1963, or for any subseque
year ;]

90.
91.

92.
93.
94.
95.

96.

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1992, w.e.f. 1-4-1993.
Prior to its omission, sub-clausweiif) read as under :

“(viii)any annuity due, or commuted value of any annuity paid, under the provisions
section 280D ;”

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1972, w.e.f. 1-4-1972.

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1996, w.e.f. 1-10-1996.

“sub-section (1) of” omitted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1989, w.r.e.

1-4-1988. Earlier, that expression was inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) A

1987, with effect from the same date.

Inserted by the Taxation Laws (Extension to Union Territories) Regulation, 1963, w.e

1-4-1963.

T Now State of Goa.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.17

CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(28A)

(26) “Indian company” means a company formed and registered und
the Companies Act, 1956 (1 of 1956), and includes—

()

*[(ia)
(ib)
(i)

*#[(iii)

a company formed and registered under any law relating f
companies formerly in force in any part of India (other than th
State of Jammu and Kashmffland the Union territories
specified in sub-clausaii() of this clause]) ;

a corporation established by or under a Central, State
Provincial Act ;

any institution, association or body which is declared by th
Board to be a company under claud&)(;]

in the case of the State of Jammu and Kashmir, a compa
formedand registered under any law for the time being in forc
in that State ;

in the case of any of the Union territories of Dadra and Nage
Haveli, Goat, Daman and Diu, and Pondicherry, acompa
formedand registered under any law for the time being in forc
in that Union territory :]

Provided that thée'[registered or, as the case may be, principal office
of the company, corporation, institution, association or body] in a
cases is in India ;

(27) 2[* * *]

(28) “Inspector of Income-tax” means a person appointed to be ¢
Inspector of Income-tax under sub-sectif(d)] of section 117 ;

4[5%(28A) “interest” means interest payable in any manner in respect of ai
moneys borrowed or debtincurred (including a deposit, claim
othersimilar right or obligation) and includes any service fee or othe
charge in respect of the moneys borrowed or debt incurred or

respect of any credit facility which has not been utilised ;]

97.

98.
99.

A

Inserted by the Taxation Laws (Extension to Union Territories) Regulation, 1963, w.e
1-4-1963.
Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1971, w.e.f. 1-4-1971.

Inserted by the Taxation Laws (Extension to Union Territories) Regulation, 1963, w.e
1-4-1963.
Substituted for “registered office of the company” by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1971, w.e
1-4-1971.
Omitted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988. Omitted clau:
(27) stood as under :

‘(27) “Inspecting Assistant Commissioner” means a person appointed to be an Inspec

Assistant Commissioner of Income-tax under sub-section (1) of section 117 ;’

Substituted for “(2)” by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.
Inserted by the Finance Act, 1976, w.e.f. 1-6-1976.

Seealso Letter F. No. 164/18/77-1T(A-I), dated 13-7-1978. For detads,Taxmann’s
Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

T Now State of Goa.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(31) I.T. ACT, 1961 1.18

5[(28B) “interest on securities” means,—

(i) interest on any security of the Central Government or a Sta
Government;

(ii) interest on debentures or other securities for money issued by
on behalf of a local authority or a company or a corporatiol
established by a Central, State or Provincial Act ;]

(280 “Joint Commissioner” means a person appointed to be a Joint Co
missioner of Income-tax or an Additional Commissioner of Incom:
taxunder sub-section (1) of section 117;

(28D) “Joint Director” means a person appointed to be a Joint Director ¢
Income-tax or an Additional Director of Income-tax under suk
section(1) of section 117;]

(29) *legal representative” has the meaning assigned to it in cldu3e{
section 2 of the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (5 of 1908) ;

[(29A) “long-term capital asset” means a capital asset which is not a sho
term capital asset ;

(29B) “long-term capital gain” means capital gain arising from the transfe
of a long-term capital asset ;]

1[(29C) “maximum marginal rate” means the rate of income-tax (includini
surcharge on income-tax, if any) applicable in relation to the highe
slab of income in the case of an individd§) association of persons
or, as the case may be, body of individuals] as specified in the Finar

Act of the relevant year ;]

(30) “non-resident” means a person who is not a “residé&ft’and for the
purposes of sections 92, 93 and 168, includes a person who is r
ordinarily resident within the meaning of clausy of section ¢, and
for the purposes of sections 92,93 * *] and 168, includes a person
who is not ordinarily resident within the meaning of sub-section (6)*o
section 6 ;

13(31) “person” includes—

(i) anindividual,

(i) a Hindu undivided family,

6. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1988, w.e.f. 1-4-1989.
7. Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1998, w.e.f. 1-10-1998.
8. Clause 11) of section 2 of the Code of Civil Procedure defines “legal representative” ¢

follows:

‘(11) “legal representative” means a person who in law represents the estate of a dece
person, and includes any person who intermeddles with the estate of the dece:
and where a party sues or is sued in arepresentative character the person onw
the estate devolves on the death of the party so suing or sued ;’

9. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.
10. Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989.
11. Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1991, w.e.f. 1-4-1991.
1la.lnserted by the Finance Act, 1999, w.&#-1999 Earlier these words were omitted by the
Finance (No. 2) Act, 1998, w.e%-4-1999.
12. “, 113” omitted by the Finance Act, 1965, w.e.f. 1-4-1965.
13. For relevant case lawseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.
* Should be ‘clauseq) of section 6’.
REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.19

(32)

(33)
(34)
14(35)

16(36)
Y1(36A)

(37)

CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(37)

(iii) a company,
(iv) afirm,

(v) an association of persons or a body of individuals, whethe
incorporated or not,

(vi) alocal authority, and
(vii) every artificial juridical person, not falling within any of the

preceding sub-clauses ;

“person who has a substantial interest in the company”, in relation
a company, means a person who is the beneficial owner of shares,
being shares entitled to a fixed rate of dividend whether with c
without a right to participate in profits, carrying not less than twent
per cent of the voting power ;

“prescribed” means prescribed by rules made under this Act ;
“previous year” means the previous year as defined in section 3 ;

“principal officer”, used with reference to a local authority or a
company or any other public body or any association of persons
any body of individuals, means—

(a) the secretary, treasurer, manager or agent of the author
company, association or body, or

(b) any person connected with the management or administration
the local authority, company, association or body upon whom th
[Assessing] Officer has served a noticenafintention oftreat-
ing him as the principal officer thereof ;

“profession” includes vocation ;

“public sector company” means any corporation established by ¢

under any Central, State or Provincial Act or a Government col

pany® as defined in section 617 of the Companies Act, 195

(10f1956);]

¥public servant” has the same meaning as in section 21 of the Indi

Penal Code (45 of 1860) ;

14. For relevant case lawseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

15. Substituted for “Income-tax” by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.
1-4-1988.

16. For relevant case lawseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

17. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1987.

18. Section 617 of the Companies Act, 1956, defines “Government company” as follows :
‘617. Definition of “Government company”.+er the purposes of this Act, Government
company means any company in which not less than fifty-one per cent of the paid-up st
capital is held by the Central Government, or by any State Government or Governme!
or partly by the Central Government and partly by one or more State Governments .
includes a company which is a subsidiary of a Government company as thus defined.’

19. Section 21 of the Indian Penal Code defines “public servant”. For text of sectiae@1l,
Appendix One.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(37A) I.T. ACT, 1961 1.20

2[(37A) “rate orratesinforce” or “ratesin force”, inrelation to an assessme

year or financial year, mean—

(i) forthe purposes of calculating income-tax under the first provis
to sub-section (5) of section 132, or computing the income-ta
chargeable under sub-section (4) of section 172 or sub-section:
of section 174 or section 175 or sub-section (2) of section 176
deducting income-tax under section 192 from income charg
ableunder the head “Salaries’* * *] or ?[computation of the
“advance tax” payable under Chapter XVII-C in a case not fallin
under?]section 115A or section 115B[or section 115BB or
section 115E] or] section 164 or section 164A5[* * *]] 2¢[or
section 167B], the rate or rates of income-tax specified
this behalf in the Finance Act of the relevant year, and for th
purposes of computation of the “advance tax” payable unde
Chapter XVII-C?7[in a case falling under section 115A or section
115B?9or section 115BB or section 115E] or section 2{ér
section 164&9***]] *9or section 167B], the rate or ratggecified
in section 115A ofY[section 115B or section 115BB or section
115E orsection 164 or section 1644* * *] 3%or section 167B], as
the case may be,] or the rate or rates of income-tax specifiec
this behalfin the Finance Act of the relevantyear, whichever
applicable ;]

(ii) forthe purposes of deduction of tax under sections 193, 194, 19/
32, 194B]3¥[, 194BB]*[and 194D], the rate or rates of income-tax
specified in this behalf in the Finance Act of the relevant year |

20.
21.

22.

23.
24.
25.

26.
27.

28.
29.

30.
31.

32.
33.
34.

Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1967, w.e.f. 1-4-1967.

“or sub-section (9) of section 80E from any payment referred to therein” omitted by t

Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989. Originally, the said expressic

was inserted by the Finance Act, 1968, w.e.f. 1-4-1968.

Substituted for ‘computation of the “advance tax” payable under Chapter XVII-C, the rg

or rates of income-tax specified in this behalf in the Finance Act of the relevant year’ |

the Finance Act, 1970, w.e.f. 1-4-1971.

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1976, w.e.f. 1-6-1976.

Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

“or section 167A” omitted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1989, w.e.f. 1-4-198!

Earlier this expression was inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.¢

1-4-1988.

Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989.

Substituted for “in a case falling under section 164, the rate specified isettiadn” by

the Finance Act, 1976, w.e.f. 1-6-1976.

Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

“or section 167A” omitted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1989, w.e.f. 1-4-198!

Earlier this expression was inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.¢

1-4-1988.

Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989.

Substituted for “section 115B or, as the case may be, section 164" by the Direct Tax Lz

(Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1972, w.e.f. 1-4-1972.

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1978, w.e.f. 1-4-1978.

Substituted for “, 194D and 195” by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1991, w.e.f. 1-10-1991.
REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN’S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.21 CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(41)

[(iii) for the purposes of deduction of tax under section 195, the ra
or rates of income-tax specified in this behalf in the Finance Ac
of the relevant year or the rate or rates of income-tax specified
an agreement entered into by the Central Government und
section 90, whichever is applicable by virtue of the provisions ©
section 90 ;]

36(38) “recognised provident fund” means a provident fund which has bee
and continues to be recognised by tH&hief Commissioner or
Commissioner] in accordance with the rules contained in Part A of tt
Fourth Schedule, and includes a provident fund established unde
scheme framed under the Employees’ Provident Funds Act, 1952 (
of 1952);

(39) 3 Omitted by the Finance Act, 1992, w.e.f. 1-4-1993.

(40) “regular assessment” means the assessment made CG&ijisieln-
section (3) of] section 143 or section 144 ;

(42) “relative”, in relation to an individual, means the husband, wife
brother or sister or any lineal ascendant or descendant of tf
individual ;

The following clause (41A) shall be inserted after clause (41) of
section 2 of the Finance Act, 1999, w.e.f. 1-4-2000 :

(41A) “resulting company” means one or more companies (including ¢
wholly owned subsidiary thereof) to which the undertaking of th
demerged company is transferred in a demerger and, the resultil
company in consideration of such transfer of undertaking, issue
shares tathe shareholders of the demerged company and includes a
authority or body or local authority or public sector company or a
company established, constituted or formed as a result of demerg

35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

Substituted by the Finance Act, 1992, w.e.f. 1-6-1992. Prior to its substitution, sub-clau

(iii), as inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1991, w.e.f. 1-10-1991, read as under :

“(iii) for the purposes of deduction of tax under section 195, the rate or rates of incon
tax specified in section 115A or the rate or rates of income-tax specified in this beh
in the Finance Act of the relevant year, whichever is applicable ;”

Seealso Circular No. 153, dated 30-11-1974. For detaike Taxmann's Master Guide to

Income-tax Act.

Substituted for “Commissioner” by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.l

1-4-1988.

Prior to omission, clause39) was substituted by the Direct Tax Laws (Second Amend-

ment) Act, 1989, w.e.f. 1-4-1989. Earlier clau$®)(was omitted by the Direct Tax Laws

(Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989 and was later reintroduced by the Direct Tax La

(Amendment) Act, 1989, w.e.f. 1-4-1989. Prior to omission, it read as under :

‘(39) “registered firm” means a firm registered under the provisions of claapeof(
sub-section (1) of section 185 or deemed to be registered under the provisions
sub-section (6) of that section or under those provisions read with sub-section |
of section 184 ;’

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1990, w.r.e.f. 1-4-1989.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(42A)
(42)

40[41(42A)

I.T. ACT, 1961 1.22

“resident” means a person who is resident in India within the meanir
of section 6 ;

4“short-term capital asset” means a capital asset held by an asses
for not more tharf¥[thirty-six] months immediately preceding the
date of its transfer :]

“[Providedthatin the case of a share held in a compporyany
othersecurity listed in a recognised stock exchange in India or a ur
of the Unit Trust of India established under the Unit Trust of India Act
1963 (52 of 1963) or a unit of a Mutual Fund specified under claus
(23D) of section 10], the provisions of this clause shall have effect
if for the words “thirty-six months”, the words “twelve months” had
been substituted.]

4[Explanation 1.—(i) In determining the period for which any capital

asset is held by the assessee—

(a) inthe case of a share held in a company in liquidation, there sh:
be excluded the period subsequent to the date on which t
company goes into liquidation ;

(b) in the case of a capital asset which becomes the property of t
assessee in the circumstances mentionéflsnb-section (1)] of
section 49, there shall be included the period for which the ass
was held by the previous owner referred to in the said sectior

“¥[(c) in the case of a capital asset being a share or shares in an Ind

company, which becomes the property of the assessee
consideration of a transfer referred to in claus® pf section 47,
there shall be included the period for which the share or shar
in the amalgamating company were held by the assessee ;]

“[(d) in the case of a capital asset, being a share or any other secu

(hereafter in this clause referred to as the financial asset) su
scribed to by the assessee on the basis of his right to subscribe
such financial asset or subscribed to by the person in who!
favour the assessee has renounced his right to subscribe to s
financial asset, the period shall be reckoned from the date
allotment of such financial asset ;

40. Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1962, w.e.f. 1-4-1962.

41. Seealso Circular No. 415, dated 14-3-1985 and Circular No. 704, dated 28-4-1995. F
details and relevant case lawsee Taxmann’'s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

42. Substituted for the portion beginning with “short-term capital asset” and ending wit
“preceding the date of its transfer ;" by the Finance Act, 1973, w.e.f. 1-4-1974. Earlier clau
(42A) was first amended by the Finance Act, 1966, w.e.f. 1-4-1966 and later by the Finar
Act, 1968, w.e.f. 1-4-1969.

43. Substituted for “sixty” by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1977, w.e.f. 1-4-1978.

44. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.

45. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1994, w.e.f. 1-4-1995.

46. Existing Explanation renumbered agxplanation 1, ibid.

47. Substituted for “clausesi)(to (iii)” by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1967, w.e.f. 1-4-1967.

48. Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1967, w.e.f. 1-4-1967.

49. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1994, w.e.f. 1-4-1995.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.23 CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 2(42C)

(e) in the case of a capital asset, being the right to subscribe to a
financial asset, which is renounced in favour of any other perso
the period shall be reckoned from the date of the offer of su
right by the company or institution, as the case may be, makir
such offer ;]

5(f) in the case of a capital asset, being a financial asset, allott
without any payment and on the basis of holding of any othe
financial asset, the period shall be reckoned from the date of tl
allotment of such financial asset ;]

The following sub-clause (g) shall be inserted after sub-clause (f)
in Explanation 1 to clause (42A) of section 2 by the Finance Act,
1999, w.e.f. 1-4-2000:

(g) inthe case of a capital asset, being a share or shares in an Indi:
company, which becomes the property of the assessee
consideration of a demerger, there shall be included the period f
which the share or shares held in the demerged company we
held by the assessee;

(ii) In respect of capital assets other than those mentioned in clat
(i), the period for which any capital assetis held by the assessee s
be determined subject to any rules which the Board may make in tt
behalf ;]

S9Explanation 2—For the purposes of this clause, the expressio
“security™?! shall have the meaning assigned to it in claugeof
section 2 of the Securities Contracts (Regulation) Act, 1956 (42 «
1956) ;]
52(42B) “short-term capital gain” means capital gain arising from the transfe
of a short-term capital asset ;]
(420) 53[* * *]

50. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1995, w.e.f. 1-4-1996.

50a.Inserted by the Finance Act, 1994, w.e.f. 1-4-1995.

51. Clause h) of section 2 of the Securities Contracts (Regulation) Act, 1956, define
“securities” as follows :
‘(h) “securities” include—

(i) shares, scrips, stocks, bonds, debentures, debenture stock or other marl
able securities of a like nature in or of any incorporated company or othe
body corporate ;

(ii) Government securities ;

(iia) such other instruments as may be declared by the Central Government to
securities ; and
(iii) rights or interest in securities ;’
52. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.
53. Omitted by the Finance Act, 1990, w.e.f. 1-4-1990. Prior to omission, clad®€),(as
inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Second Amendment) Act, 1989, w.e.f. 1-4-1990, read
under :

‘(420)"“security” means a Government security as defined in cla@yeof( section 2 of the
Public Debt Act, 1944 (18 of 1944) ;

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S. 2(44) I.T. ACT, 1961 1.24

The following clause (42C) shall be inserted after clause (42B) of
section 2 by the Finance Act, 1999, w.e.f. 1-4-2000:

(42C) “slump sale” means the transfer of one or more undertakings as
result of the sale for a lump sum consideration without values beir
assigned to the individual assets and liabilities in such sales.

Explanation 1—For the purposes of this clause, “undertaking” shall
have the meaning assigned to itBrplanation 1to clause {9AA).
Explanation 2—For the removal of doubts, itis hereby declared tha
the determination of the value of an asset or liability for the sol
purpose of payment of stamp duty, registration fees or other simil:
taxes or fees shall not be regarded as assignment of values to individi
assets or liabilities ;

5{(43) “tax”inrelation to the assessment year commencing on the 1st day
April, 1965, and any subsequent assessment year means income-
chargeable under the provisions of this Act, and in relation to ar
other assessmentyearincome-tax and super-tax chargeable u
theprovisions of this Act prior to the aforesaid date ;]

%[(43A) “tax credit certificate” means a tax credit certificate granted to an

personin accordance with the provisions of Chapter XXfaBd any
scheme made thereunder ;]

(438) 57[* * *]

8[(44) “Tax Recovery Officer” means any Income-tax Officer who may be
authorised by the Chief Commissioner or Commissioner, by gene
or special order in writing, to exercise the powers of a Tax Recove

54.
55.
56.
57.

58.

Substituted by the Finance Act, 1965, w.e.f. 1-4-1965.
Inserted, ibid.
Chapter XXII-B has been omitted with effect from 1-4-1990.
Omitted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989. Original claus
(43B) was inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1971, w.e.f. 1-1-1972 and read as unde
‘(43B)“Tax Recovery Commissioner” means a Commissioner or an Assistant Commi
sioner of Income-tax who may be authorised by the Central Government, by general
special notification in the Official Gazette, to exercise the powers of a Tax Recove
Commissioner ;’
Substituted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987 [as amended by the Direct T
Laws (Amendment) Act, 1989], w.r.e.f. 1-4-1988. Prior to its substitution, cladde &s
substituted by the Finance Act, 1963, w.r.e.f. 1-4-1962, stood as under :
‘(44) “Tax Recovery Officer” means—
(i) a Collector or an Additional Collector ;
(ii) any such officer empowered to effect recovery of arrears of land revenue
other public demand under any law relating to land revenue or other publ
demand for the time being in force in the State as may be authorised by t
State Government, by general or special notification in the Official Gazette
to exercise the powers of a Tax Recovery Officer ;
(iii) any Gazetted Officer of the Central or a State Government who may b
authorised by the Central Government, by general or special notification i
the Official Gazette, to exercise the powers of a Tax Recovery Officer ;

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.25

CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 3

Officer ;]

(45) “totalincome” means the total amount ofincome referred to |
section 5, computeid the manner laid down in this Act ;

(46) 59[* * *]
5047) ®Y“transfer”, in relation to a capital asset, includes,—
(i) the sale, exchange or relinquishment of the asset ; or
(ii) the extinguishment of any rights therein ; or
(iii) the compulsory acquisition thereof under any law ; or

(iv) in a case where the asset is converted by the owner thereof in
or is treated by him as, stock-in-trade of a business carried on
him, such conversion or treatment?or]

82[(v) any transaction involving the allowing of the possession of an
immovable property to be taken or retained in part performan
of a contract of the nature referred to in section 834 the
Transfer of Property Act, 1882 (4 of 1882) ; or

(vi) any transaction (whether by way of becoming a member of, ¢
acquiring shares in, a co-operative society, company or oth
association of persons or by way of any agreement or a
arrangenent or in any other manner whatsoever) which has th
effect of transferring, or enabling the enjoyment of, any immov
able property.

Explanation—For the purposes of sub-clause§ @nd (i),
“immovable property” shall have the same meaning as in claus
(d) of section 269UA.]

(48) %Omitted by the Finance Act, 1992, w.e.f. 1-4-1993.

s5[66“Previous year” defined.

3.

(1) Save as otherwise provided in this section, “previous year” for tt
purposes of this Act, means the financial year immediately preceding t

assessment year :

59.
60.

61.

62.
63.
64.

65.

Omitted by the Finance Act, 1965, w.e.f. 1-4-1965.
For relevant case lawseeTaxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax A&eealso Circular
No. 751, dated 10-2-1997 on Stock Lending Scheme.
Substituted for the following by the Taxation Laws (Amendment) Act, 1984, w.e.f
1-4-1985 :
‘ “transfer”, in relation to a capital asset, includes the sale, exchange or relinquishment
the asset or the extinguishment of any rights therein or the compulsory acquisition ther
under any law ;’
Inserted by the Finance Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1988.
For text of section 53A of the Transfer of Property Act, 1882e Appendix One.
Prior to omission clause48), as reintroduced by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act,
1989, w.e.f. 1-4-1989 which was earlier omitted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Ac
1987, with effect from the same date, read as under :
‘(48) “unregistered firm” means a firm which is not a registered firm.’
Substituted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989. Prior to i
substitution, section 3 as amended by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e
1-4-1988 stood as under :

(Contd. on p. 1.26)

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S.

I.T. ACT, 1961 1.26

Provided that, in the case of a business or profession newly set up, or a sou
of income newly coming into existence, in the said financial year, the previo
year shall be the period beginning with the date of setting up of the busines:

(Contd. from p. 1.25)

66.

‘3. “Previous year” defined—(1) For the purposes of this Act, “previous year’ means—
(a) the financial year immediately preceding the assessment year ; or
(b) if the accounts of the assessee have been made up to a date within the said finar
year, then, at the option of the assessee, the twelve months ending on such date
(c) in the case of any person or business or class of persons or business not falling wit
clause &) or clause If), such period as may be determined by the Board or by an
authority authorised by the Board in this behalf ; or
(d) in the case of a business or profession newly set up in the said financial year, |
period beginning with the date of the setting up of the business or profession and

(i) ending with the said financial year, or

(ii) if the accounts of the assessee have been made up to a date within the ¢
financial year, then, at the option of the assessee, ending on that date, or

(iii) ending with the period, if any, determined under claude (

as the case may be ; or
(e) in the case of a business or profession newly set up in the twelve montl
immediately preceding the said financial year—

(i) if the accounts of the assessee have been made up to a date within the ¢
financial year and the period from the date of the setting up of the busine:
or profession to such date does not exceed twelve months, then, at the opt
of the assessee, such period, or

(ii) if any period has been determined under clawde then the period beginning
with the date of the setting up of the business or profession and ending wi
that period,

as the case may be ; or
(f) where the assessee is a partner in a firm and the firm has been assessed as such,
in respect of the assessee’s share in the income of the firm, the period determir
as the previous year for the assessment of the income of the firm ; or
(g) in respect of profits and gains from life insurance business, the year immediate

preceding the assessment year for which annual accounts are required to
prepared under the Insurance Act, 1938 (4 of 1938), or under that Act read wi
section 43 of the Life Insurance Corporation Act, 1956 (31 of 1956).

(2) Where an assessee has newly set up a business or profession in the said financial

and his accounts are made up to a date in the assessment year in respect of a periot

exceeding twelve months from the date of such setting up, then, notwithstaalynking

contained in sub-clausaeii() of clause ) of sub-section (1), the assessee shall, in respec

of that business or profession, at his option, be deemed to have no previous year for

said assessment year under that clause and such option shall, in relation to

immediately succeeding assessment year, have effect as an option exercised under

clause () of clause ¢) of sub-section (1).

(3) Subject to the other provisions of this section, an assessee may have different previ

years in respect of separate sources of his income.

(4) Where in respect of a particular source of income or in respect of a business

profession newly set up, an assessee has once exercised the option underbrlausailf-

clause (i) of clause @) or sub-clausei] of clause €) of sub-section (1) or has once been

assessed, then, he shall not, in respect of that source, or, as the case may be, busine

profession, be entitled to vary the meaning of the expression “previous year” as th

applicable to him, except with the consent of the Assessing Officer and upon su

conditions asthe Assessing Officer may think fit to impose.’

Seealso PIB Press Release, dated 10-6-1988 and Instruction F.No. 165/4/88-IT(A-

dated 4-2-1988. For detailsee Taxmann’'s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.27 CH. | - PRELIMINARY S. 3

profession or, as the case may be, the date on which the source of income ne
comes into existence and ending with the said financial year.

(2) “Previous year”, in relation to the assessment year, commencing on the 1st
of April, 1989, means the period which begins with the date immediate
following the last day of the previous year relevant to the assessment y
commencing on the 1st day of April, 1988 and ends on the 31st day of March, 19t

57Provided that where the assessee has adopted more than one period as
“previous year” in relation to the assessment year commencing on the 1st da:
April, 1988 for different sources of hisincome, the previous year in relation to tl
assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1989 shall be recko
separately in the manner aforesaid in respect of each such source of income,
the longer or the longest of the periodssokoned shall be the previous year for
the said assessment year :

%8 Provided further that in the case of a business or profession newly set up,
a source of income newly coming into existence on or after the 1st day of Api
1987 but before the 1st day of April, 1988 and where the accounts in relatior
such business or profession or source of income have not been made up tc
31st day of March, 1988, the “previous year” in relation to the assessment y
commencing on the 1st day of April, 1989, shall be the period beginning with t
date of setting up of the business or profession or, as the case may be, the
on which the source of income newly comes into existence and ending on the :
day of March, 1989 :

5Provided alsothat where the assessee has adopted one or more periods as
“previous year” in relation to the assessment year commencing on the 1st da
April, 1988, for any source or sources of his income, in addition to the busine
or profession or source of income referred to in the second proviso, the previt
yearin relation to the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1¢
shall be reckoned separately in the manner aforesaid in respect of each ¢
source of income, and the longer or the longest of the periods so reckoned s
be the previous year in relation to the said assessment year.]

(3) Where the previous year in relation to the assessment year commencing
the 1st day of April, 1989, referred to in sub-section (2) exceeds a period of twe
months, the provisions of this Act shall apply subject to the modificatior
specified in the rules in the Tenth Schedule.]

The following section 3 shall be substituted for the existing section 3 by the

Finance Act, 1999, w.e.f. 1-4-2000:

“Previous year” defined.

3. For the purposes of this Act, “previous year” means the financial year immq
diately preceding the assessment year :

Provided that, in the case of a business or profession newly set up, or a source

income newly coming into existence, in the said financial year, the preyéaus

67. See rule 125 for rules for calculation of deductions/allowance for the transitiona
previous year relating to assessment year 1989-90.

68. Inserted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1989, w.e.f. 1-4-1989.

69. Seerule 125.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S.5 I.T. ACT, 1961 1.28

shall be the period beginning with the date of setting up of the business
profession or, as the case may be, the date on which the source of income ne
comes into existence and ending with the said financial year.

CHAPTER I
BASIS OF CHARGE

Charge of income-tax.

°4.7(1) Where any Central Act enacts that income-tax shall be charged f
any assessmentyear at any rate or rates, income-tax atthatrate or:

ratesshall be charged for that year in accordance with, ‘gsdbject to the

provisions (including provisions for the levy of additional income-tax) of, thi

Act] in respect of the total income of the previous y&ar* *] of every person :

Provided that where by virtue of any provision of this Act income-tax is to b
charged inrespect of the income of a period other than the previousy
income-tax shall be charged accordingly.

(2) In respect of income chargeable under sub-section (1), income-tax shal
deducted at the source or paid in advance, where it is so deductible or pay:
under any provision of this Act.

Scope of totalincome.
745,75(1) Subject to the provisions of this Act, the total income of any previot
year of a person who is a resident includes all income from whatever sou
derived which—
(a) isreceived or is deemed to be received in India in such year by or
behalf of such person ; or
(b) accruesorarises oris deemed to accrue or arise to him in India dur
such year ; or
(c) accrues or arises to him outside India during such year :
Providedthat, in the case of a person not ordinarily resident in Indi
within the meaning of sub-section (6)* of section 6, the income whic
accrues or arises to him outside India shall not be so included unle
it is derived from a business controlled in or a profession set up
India.

70. Seealso Circular No. 142, dated 1-8-1974, Circular No. 447, dated 22-1-1986, Circular N
573, dated 21-8-1990, Letter No. 75/19/191/62-1TJ, dated 24-8-1966 and Instruction N
747 [F. No. 288/29/74-IT(A-I)], (relevant extracts), dated 30-8-1974. For detads,
Taxmann’s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

71. For relevant case lawsee Taxmann’'s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

72. Substituted for “subject to the provisions of this Act” by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment
Act, 1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989.

73. “or previous years, as the case may be,” omitted by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) A
1987, w.e.f. 1-4-1989.

74. Seealso Circular No. 369, dated 17-9-1983. For detaslse Taxmann's Master Guide to
Income-tax Act.

75. For relevant case lawsee Taxmann's Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

*Should be clause€.
REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.29 CH. Il - BASIS OF CHARGE S. 6

(2) Subjectto the provisions of this Act, the total income of any previous yea
aperson who is a non-resident includes all income from whatever source deri
which—
(a) isreceived or is deemed to be received in India in such year by or
behalf of such person ; or

(b) accruesorarises oris deemed to accrue or arise to him in India dur
such year.
Explanation =—Income accruing or arising outside India shall notbe detamexc
be received in India within the meaning of this section by reason only of the fe
that it is taken into account in a balance sheet prepared in India.

Explanation 2—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that incom
which has been included in the total income of a person on the basis that it
accrued or arisen or is deemed to have accrued or arisen to him shall not al
be so included on the basis that it is received or deemed to be received by
in India.

"![Apportionment of income between spouses governed by Portuguese Civil
Code.

5A.(1) Where the husband and wife are governed by the system of com
nity of property (known under the Portuguese Civil Code of 1860
“COMMUNIAO DOS BENS") inforce inthe State of Goaand in the Union territorie
of Dadra and Nagar Haveli and Daman and Diu, the income of the husbanc
of the wife under any head of income shall not be assessed as that of
community of property (whether treated as an association of persons or a |
of individuals), but suchincome of the husband and of the wife under eacht
ofincome (other than under the head “Salaries”) shall be apportioned equ
between the husband and the wife and the income so apportioned she
included separately in the total income of the husband and of the wife resp
tively, and the remaining provisions of this Act shall apply accordingly.
(2) Where the husband or, as the case may be, the wife governed by the afol
system of community of property has any income under the head “Salaries”,
income shall be included in the totalincome of the spouse who has actu
earned it.]

Residence in India.
6. For the purposes of this Act,—
(1) Anindividual is said to be resident in India in any previous year, if he-
(a) isinIndiain that year for a period or periods amounting in all t
one hundred and eighty-two days or more ; or
(b) 78[* * *]
(c) having within the four years preceding that year been in India fc
a period or periods amounting in all to three hundred and sixt
five days or more, isin India for a period or periods amountir
in all to sixty days or more in that year.

76. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1994, w.r.e.f. 1-4-1963.
77. For relevant case lawsee Taxmann’'s Master Guide to Income-tax Act.
78. Omitted by the Finance Act, 1982, w.e.f. 1-4-1983.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



I.T. ACT, 1961 1.30

[Explanation—In the case of an individual,—

(a) being acitizen of India, who leaves India in any previous $fas
a member of the crew of &indian ship as defined in clauskg)
of section 3 of the Merchant Shipping Act, 1958 (44 of 1958), or
for the purposes of employment outside India, the provisions ¢
sub-claused) shall apply in relation to that year as if for the words
“sixty days”, occurring therein, the words “one hundred anc
eighty-two days” had been substituted ;

(b) being a citizen of India, or a person of Indian origin within the
meaning oExplanationto clause¢) of section 115C, who, being
outside India, comes on a visit to India in any previous year, tf
provisions of sub-clause) shall apply in relation to that year as
if for the words “sixty days”, occurring therein, the words “one
hundred and?eighty-two] days” had been substituted.]

(2) AHinduundivided family, firm or other association of persons is sai
to be residentin India in any previous year in every case except whe
during that year the control and management of its affairs is situat
wholly outside India.

(3) A company is said to be resident in India in any previous year, if-
(i) itis an Indian company ; or
(ii) during that year, the control and management of its affairs i

situated wholly in India.

(4) Every other personis said to be resident in India in any previous ye
in every case, except where during that year the control and mana
ment of his affairs is situated wholly outside India.

(5) If a person is resident in India in a previous year relevant t
an assessment year in respect of any source of income, he st
be deemed to be resident in India in the previous year relevant
the assessment year in respect of each of his other sources
income.

79.

80.
81.

82.

Substituted by the Direct Tax Laws (Second Amendment) Act, 1989, w.e.f. 1-4-199
Original Explanation, as inserted by the Finance Act, 1978, w.e.f. 1-4-1979 and late
amended by the Finance Act, 1982, w.e.f. 1-4-1983, read as under :
‘Explanation—In the case of an individual, being a citizen of India,—

(a) who leaves India in any previous year for the purposes of employment outside Ind
the provisions of sub-clause)(shall apply in relation to that year as if for the words
“sixty days”, occurring therein, the words “one hundred and eighty-two days” ha
been substituted ;

(b) who, being outside India, comes on a visit to India in any previous year, th
provisions of sub-clausec) shall apply in relation to that year as if for the words
“sixty days”, occurring therein, the words “ninety days” had been substituted.

Inserted by the Finance Act, 1990, w.e.f. 1-4-1990.

Clause 18) of section 3 of the Merchant Shipping Act, 1958, defines “Indian ship” a:

follows :

‘(18) “Indian ship” means a ship registered as such under this Act and includes any sl
registered at any port in India at the commencement of this Act which is recognis
as an Indian ship under the proviso to sub-section (2) of section 22 ;

Substituted for “fifty” by the Finance Act, 1994, w.e.f. 1-4-1995.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



131 CH. Il - BASIS OF CHARGE S.9

(6) Apersonissaidtobe “notordinarily resident” in India in any previou
year if such person is—

(a) anindividual who has not been resident in India in nine out of th
ten previous years preceding that year, or has not during tl
seven previous years preceding that year been in India for
period of, or periods amounting in all to, seven hundred and thirt
days or more ; or

(b) aHinduundivided family whose manager has not been resid:
in India in nine out of the ten previous years preceding that yes
or has not during the seven previous years preceding that ye
beeninIndiafor a period of, or periods amounting in all to, seve
hundred and thirty days or more.

Income deemed to be received.
7. The following incomes shall be deemed to be received in the previous year

(i) the annual accretion in the previous year to the balance at the cre
of an employee participating in a recognised provident fund, to tt
extent provided in rule 6 of Part A of the Fourth Schedule ;

(ii) the transferred balance in a recognised provident fund, to the exte
provided in sub-rule (4) of rule 11 of Part A of the Fourth Schedule

Dividend income.
8. 8[For the purposes of inclusion in the total income of an assessee,—

(a) anydividend] declared by a company or distributed or paid by
within the meaning of sub-clausa)(or sub-clausel) or sub-clause
(c) or sub-claused) or sub-claused) of clause 22) of section 2 shall
be deemed to be the income of the previous year in which it is
declared, distributed or paid, as the case may be ;

80(b) any interim dividend shall be deemed to be the income of the previo
year in which the amount of such dividend is unconditionally mad
available by the company to the member who is entitled to it.]

Income deemed to accrue or arise in India.
859, 85(1) The following incomes shall be deemed to accrue or arise in India :-

87(i) allincome accruing or arising, whether directly or indirectly, throug!
or from any business connection in India, or through or from an
property in India, or through or from any asset or source of incor

83. Substituted for “For the purposes of inclusion in the total income of an assessee, ¢
dividend” by the Finance Act, 1965, w.e.f. 1-4-1965.

84. Inserted,ibid.

85. Seealso Circular No. 23, dated 23-7-1969, Circular No. 163, dated 29-5-1975, Circular N
35(XXXIII-7) of 1956, dated 3-9-1956, Circular No. 4, dated 20-2-1969 and Circular38®.,
dated 4-5-1984. For detailsee Taxmann's Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

86. For relevant case lawsee Taxmann's Master Guide to Income-tax Act.

87. Seerule 10 for manner of computation of income of non-residents in certain cases.
also Appendix Two for an analysis of rule 10.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



I.T. ACT, 1961 1.32

in India, 8[* * *] or through the transfer of a capital asset situate in
India.

Explanation—For the purposes of this clause—

(a) in the case of a business of which all the operations are n
carried outin India, the income of the business deemed under tt
clause to accrue or arise in India shall be only such part of tt
income as is reasonably attributable to the operations carried c
in India ;

(b) in the case of a non-resident, no income shall be deemed
accrue or arise in India to him through or from operations whic
are confined to the purchase of goods in India for the purpose
export ;

89[* * *]

%[(c) in the case of a non-resident, being a person engaged in t
business of running a news agency or of publishing newspape
magazines or journals, no income shall be deemed to accrue
arise in Indiato him through or from activities which are confinec
to the collection of news and views in India for transmission ou
of India ;]

°Y(d) in the case of a non-resident, being—

(1) anindividual who is not a citizen of India ; or

(2) afirmwhich does nothave any partnerwhois acitizen «
Indiaor who is resident in India ; or
(3) a company which does not have any shareholder who is
citizen of India or who is resident in India,
no income shall be deemed to accrue or arise in India to su
individual, firm or company through or from operations whict
areconfined to the shooting of any cinematograph filmin India ;
(i) income which falls under the head “Salaries”, if it is earned in Indic
[Explanation—For the removal of doubts, itis hereby declared tha
income of the nature referred to in this clause payable for servi
rendered in India shall be regarded as income earned in India ;]

The following Explanation shall be substituted for the existing
Explanation to clause (ii) of sub-section (1) of section 9 by the Finance
Act, 1999, w.e.f. 1-4-2000:

Explanation—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared tha
the income of the nature referred to in this clause payable for—
(a) service rendered in India; and

. “or through or from any money lent at interest and brought into India in cash or in kinc
omitted by the Finance Act, 1976, w.e.f. 1-6-1976.

. Proviso omitted by the Finance Act, 1964, w.e.f. 1-4-1964.

. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1983, w.r.e.f. 1-4-1962.

. Inserted by the Taxation Laws (Amendment) Act, 1984, w.r.e.f. 1-4-1982.

. Inserted by the Finance Act, 1983, w.r.e.f. 1-4-1979.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.33

CH. Il - BASIS OF CHARGE S.9

(b) the rest period or leave period which is preceded and succeed:
by services rendered in India and forms part of the semicgract
of employment,

shall be regarded as income earned in India ;

(iii) income chargeable under the head “Salaries” payable by the Gove
ment to a citizen of India for service outside India ;
(iv) a dividend paid by an Indian company outside India ;
%[(v) income by way of interest payable by—
(a) the Government ; or
(b) apersonwhois aresident, except where the interestis payable
respect of any debt incurred, or moneys borrowed and used, f
the purposes of a business or profession carried on by su
person outside India or for the purposes of making or earning at
income from any source outside India ; or
(c) a person who is a non-resident, where the interest is payable
respect of any debt incurred, or moneys borrowed and used, f
the purposes of a business or profession carried on by su
person in India ;
(vi) income by way of royalty payable by—

(a) the Government ; or

(b) apersonwho is aresident, except where the royalty is payable
respect of any right, property or information used or service
utilised for the purposes of a business or profession carried on
such person outside India or for the purposes of making
earningany income from any source outside India ; or

(c) a person who is a non-resident, where the royalty is payable
respect of any right, property or information used or service
utilised for the purposes of a business or profession carried on
such personin India or for the purposes of making or earning ar
income from any source in India :

Provided that nothing contained in this clause shall apply in relatiol
to so much of the income by way of royalty as consists of lump su
consideration for the transfer outside India of, or the imparting c
information outside India in respect of, any data, documentatiol
drawing or specification relating to any patent, invention, mode
design, secretformula or process or trade mark or similar propel
if such income is payable in pursuance of an agreement made bef
the 1st day of April, 1976, and the agreement is approved by tl
Central Government:

%[ Provided further that nothing contained in this clause shall apply
in relation to so much of the income by way of royalty as consists «

93. Clauses V), (vi) and {ii) inserted by the Finance Act, 1976, w.e.f. 1-6-1976.
94. Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1991, w.e.f. 1-4-1991.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



S.9 I.T. ACT, 1961 1.34

lump sum payment made by a person, who is aresident, for
transferof all or any rights (including the granting of a licence) in
respect of computer software supplied by a non-resident manufe
turer along with a computer or computer-based equipment unc
any scheme approved under the Policy on Computer Softw:
Export, Software Development and Training, 1986 oGihern-
ment of India.]

Explanation 1—For the purposes of tHgfirst] proviso, an agrement
made on or after the 1st day of April, 1976, shall be deemed to ha
been made before that date if the agreementis made in accord:
with proposals approved by the Central Government before that da
so, however, that, where the recipient of the income by way of royal
is aforeign company, the agreement shall not be deemed to have b
made before that date unless, before the expiry of the time allow
under sub-section (1) or sub-section (2) of section 139 (whether fix
originally or on extension) for furnishing the return of income for the
assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1977, or t
assessment year in respect of which such income first becom
chargeable to tax under this Act, whichever assessment year is lat
the company exercises an option by furnishing a declaration
writing to the®[Assessing] Officer (such option being final for that
assessment year and for every subsequent assessment year) tha
agreement may be regarded as an agreement made before the 1st
of April, 1976.

Explanation 2—For the purposes of this clause, “royalty” means
consideration (including any lump sum consideration but excludin
any consideration which would be the income of the recipie
chargeble under the head “Capital gains”) for—

(i) thetransfer of all or any rights (including the granting of
licence)in respect of a patent, invention, model, design, secre
formula or process or trade mark or similar property ;

(ii) theimparting of any information concerning the working of, o
theuse of, a patent, invention, model, design, secret formula ¢
process or trade mark or similar property ;

(iii) the use of any patent, invention, model, design, secret formula
process or trade mark or similar property ;

(iv) the imparting of any information concerning technical, indus:
trial, commercial or scientific knowledge, experience or skill ;

(v) the transfer of all or any rights (including the granting of
licence)inrespect of any copyright, literary, artistic or scientific
work including films or video tapes for use in connection with
television or tapes for use in connection with radio broadcastin:

95. Substituted for “foregoing”, by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1991, w.e.f. 1-4-1991
96. Substituted for “Income-tax” by the Direct Tax Laws (Amendment) Act, 1987, w.e.f
1-4-1988.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



1.35 CH. Il - BASIS OF CHARGE S.9

but notincluding consideration for the sale, distribution o
exhibition of cinematographic films ; or

(vi) the rendering of any services in connection with the activitie
referred to in sub-clauseg) to (v).

STExplanation 3—For the purposes of this clause, the expressio
“computer software” shall have the meaning assigned to it in clau
(b) of theExplanationto section 80HHE ;]

(vii) income by way of fees for technical services payable by—
(a) the Government ; or

(b) a person who is a resident, except where the fees are payable
respect of services utilised in a business or profession carried
by such person outside India or for the purposes of making «
earning any income from any source outside India ; or

(c) a person who is a non-resident, where the fees are payable
respect of services utilised in a business or profession carried
by such person in India or for the purposes of making or earnir
any income from any source in India :

% Providedthat nothing contained in this clause shall apply in relatic
to any income by way of fees for technical services payable
pursuance of an agreement made before the 1stday of April, 1S
and approved by the Central Government.]

[Explanation 1—For the purposes of the foregoing proviso, an
agreement made on or after the 1st day of April, 1976, shall be deen
to have been made before that date if the agreement is made
accordance with proposals approved by the Central Governme
before that date.]

Explanation![2].—For the purposes of this clause, “fees for technica
services” means any consideration (including any lump sum cons
deration) for the rendering of any managerial, technical or consultan
services (including the provision of services of technical or othe
personnel) but does not include consideration for any constructio
assembly, mining or like project undertaken by the recipient
consideration which would be income of the recipient chargeat
under the head “Salaries”.]

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), any pension payal
outside India to a person residing permanently outside India shall not be deer
to accrue or arise in India, if the pension is payable to a person referred
article314 of the Constitution or to a person who, having been appointed befc
the 15th day of August, 1947, to be a Judge of the Federal Court or of a High Cc
within the meaning of the Government of India Act, 1935, continues to serve
or after the commencement of the Constitution as a Judge in India.

97. Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1991, w.e.f. 1-4-1991.
98. Inserted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1977, w.e.f. 1-4-1977.
99. Inserted,ibid.
1. Inserted,ibid.

REPRODUCED FROM TAXMANN'S INCOME-TAX ACT, 1999 EDITION



